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Listed below please find basic information on a number of outside funding sources with 
restricted eligibility. We hope this information is helpful and will try to provide an updated 
listing of outside aid periodically. We have asked for updated information from these 
organizations; they may not have responded by the time of this publication. We are providing 
this listing as accurately as we have it at this time.  
 
 
 

American Indian Graduate Center Fellowship Program 
 
Provides financial support for full-time students who are members of federally-recognized 
American Indian or Native American tribes to continue their education at the master's, 
doctorate and professional degree level. Information and application materials can be obtained 
from the American Indian Graduate Center, 3701 San Mateo NE, #200, Albuquerque, NM 
87110, (800) 628-1920,  https://accessscholarships.com/scholarship/american-indian-graduate-
center-aigc-graduate-fellowship/  
 
 

American Pharmacists Association (APhA) Foundation Student Scholarship Program 
 
Provides support to students who invest time in their school’s APhA-ASP chapter to help shape 
the profession. To qualify, you must demonstrate strong academic performance, involvement in 
school and community activities, and potential to become a leader of the profession of 
pharmacy. Most awards are for $1,000, with the exception of the Foundation’s George F. 
Archambault scholarship, which is for $1,500. 
http://www.aphafoundation.org/student-scholarship-program  
 

  
                                             American Society of Consultant Pharmacists 
 
Supports third year students who have completed geriatric pharmacotherapy coursework 
and/or a geriatrics rotation and have a cumulative GPA of at least 3.0.  Preference will be given 
to PharmD candidates applying for a geriatric residency.  For more information contact the  
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Arnold S. Feldman Memorial Senior Care Pharmacy Scholarship, American Society of Consultant 
Pharmacists Research and Education Foundation, (800) 355-2727, ext. 252.  
http://www.ascpfoundation.org 
 
 

American Society of Health-System Pharmacist 
 

Supports students who have demonstrated leadership ability and have an interest in pharmacy 
practice. ASHP offers up to twelve awards each year. To be eligible, you must be a pharmacy 
student in your second, third, or fourth year of the program. The award consists of a plaque, an 
ASHP drug information reference library, and a $2,000 cash award provided by the ASHP 
Research and Education Foundation through the Walter Jones Memorial Pharmacy Student 
Financial Aid Fund. http://www.ashp.org/studentleadershipaward 
 

 
The BECA Foundation, Inc. Alice Newell Joslyn Fund 

 
Provides support for Latino students residing in San Diego County who are entering the 
Medical/Health Care profession. Eligibility is contingent upon a student’s financial need, 
scholastic determination, and community/cultural awareness. Scholarships range from $500 to 
$2,000 per year and are awarded annually for four years contingent on scholastic progress. 
Applications are available in January and the deadline is March 1. Applications may be obtained 
from: The BECA Foundation, P.O. Box 936, Escondido, CA 92033, (760) 741-8246, 
http://www.becafoundation.org 
 
 

Hispanic Scholarship Fund 
 
Provides support for Hispanic students who are permanent residents or citizens of the U.S., 
who have earned at least 15 undergraduate units from an accredited college or university, who 
have a minimum GPA of 3.0 and who are enrolled full-time. Awards range from $500 to $5,000. 
Information can be obtained from Hispanic Scholarship Fund, 1411 W. 190th St., Suite 700, 
Gardena, CA  90248, (310) 975-3700, http://www.hsf.net 
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Indian Health Services Scholarship Programs 
 
Health Professions Scholarship: Provides financial aid covering tuition, fees, and educational 
and living expenses for qualified students who are applying to, accepted by, or enrolled in a 
health profession program. You incur a service obligation if you accept funding from this 
program, and priority is generally given to graduate students. 
http://www.ihs.gov/scholarship/index.cfm 
 
 

The National Association of Chain Drug Stores Foundation (NACDS) – Scholarship Program 
 
Applicants are selected based on their career goals and work experience in community 
pharmacy. The NACDS Foundation strongly supports the educational development of those 
students intending to pursue a career in community pharmacy practice. NACDS Foundation, 
1776 Wilson Blvd., Ste200, Arlington, VA 22209 (703) 837-4278, 
http://www.nacdsfoundation.org/  
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
The National Community Pharmacist Association (NCPA) Scholarships 

 
Provides support for pharmacy students for educational expenses.  Awards will be made based 
on academic achievement, leadership qualities and accomplishments, as well as involvement in 
extracurricular activities.  The National Community Pharmacists Association, (800) 544-7447 
http://www.ncpafoundation.org/downloads/scholarshipapplication2014.pdf 
 
 

Scholarship Foundation of Santa Barbara 
 
Applicant must have originally graduated from a high school in Santa Barbara County, or be an 
adult re-entry student who has resided in Santa Barbara, California for a minimum of the last 
three years as a non-student. Applicant must be a full-time student in the areas of medicine, 
law, dentistry, pharmacy, veterinary medicine, business, education, and a variety of Master's 
and Ph.D. programs. Applicant must complete a Scholarship Foundation application and submit 
with all supporting materials by January 31.  A personal interview in Santa Barbara, CA is 
required in March. Applications are available by sending a self-addressed, double-stamped long 
envelope with a written request to Scholarship Foundation of Santa Barbara, P.O. Box 3620, 
Santa Barbara, CA 93130, (805) 687-6065, www.sbscholarship.org 
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The Tylenol ® Brand Health Eduation Scholarship 
 
Provides scholarships for students pursuing health-related studies. Applicants are judged on 
leadership qualities and academic performance. Website http://www.tylenol.com 
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